ADDENDUM NO. 4

RFP-PW-10-10

Debris Removal Services

ISSUE DATE: May 27, 2010

BID DATE: June 1, 2010 @ 2:00pm

SUBJECT: Previous Bid Opening Tabulation

INTENT: This addendum is issued prior to the date bids are due in order to incorporate the
following clarifications, additions, omissions, deletions, or changes into the Contract
Documents.

Except as hereinafter specified, the work shall be in accordance with the drawings and
specifications.

Bidders are to use the changed quantities of the items listed in this addendum in their
proposals, and it shall become a part of the Contract Documents when construction is
executed.

Bidders are reminded that this addendum must be noted on the “Official City Acknowledgment Form”

when they submit their proposal. A signed copy of the addendum must also be included with the bid
submittal.

1. Question: Could we see the Bid Opening Tabulation from the last time this project was bid?
Answer: Please see attached.

Acknowledgment:

Signature and Date

Printed Name and Title

Company Name

END OF ADDENDUM NO. 4

* Twelve Pages to Follow.

Page 1 of 1
RFP-PW-10-10 - Debris Removal Services



Bid Number: RFP-PW-07-03
Date: March 26,2007

Construction Tower & Breakdown

Name: Debris Management & Removal Services
Time: 2:00 P.M.

Material Equipment Labor Sub-Total OH & Profit Total
Contractor Misc, Small 15%
[D & J Enterprises $1,200.00 $300.00 $250.00 $1,750.00 $263.00 $2,013.00
Disaster Mitigation & Construction Group See Prposal See Prposal See Prposal See Prposal See Prposal See Prposal
Ceres Environmental See Prposal See Prposal See Prposal See Prposal See Prposal See Prposal
AshBritt See Prposal See Prposal See Prposal See Prposal See Prposal See Prposal
Omni Pinnacle See Prposal See Prposal See Prposal See Prposal | Prp| See Prposal See Prposal
Bamaco Inc. See Prposal See Prposal See Prposal See Prposal | Prp| See Prposal See Prposal
Crowder Gulf See Prposal See Prposal See Prposal See Prposal | Prp| See Prposal See Prposal
J.B. Coxwell Contracting Inc See Prposal See Prposal See Prposal See Prposal [ Prp| See Prposal See Prposal
ATL Disaster Recovery See Prposal See Prposal See Prposal See Prposal | Prp| See Prposal See Prposal
Phillips & Jordan Inc. See Prposal See Prposal See Prposal See Prposal [Prp| See Prposal See Prposal
DRC Emergency Services LLC See Prposal See Prposal See Prposal See Prposal [ Prp| See Prposal See Prposal
Asplundh See Prposal See Prposal See Prposal See Prposal See Prposal See Prposal
Wood Resource Recovery LLC See Prposal See Prposal See Prposal See Prposal See Prposal See Prposal

Crowder Disaster Recovery Division

See Proposal

See Proposal

See Proposal

See Proposal

See Proposal

See Proposal

Baker Emergency Services

See Proposal

See Proposal

See Proposal

See Proposal

See Proposal

See Proposal




Bid Number: RFP-PW-07-03 Name: Debris Management & Removal St
Date: March 26,2007 Time: 2:00 P.M.

Emergency Debris Clearance (Push)

* with operator 3 capcity **see page 45 of bid for more details
Rubber Tire Two Person Crew Crew Foreman Track Hoe
Contractor Dump Truck Front end w/chainsaw w/Pick-up 1/2 Excavator
16-20 yds 3 Cap* loader 3-5 yd* 16" min** to 1 ton w/phone 2-3 yd bucket*
hourly hourly hourly hourly hourly
D & J Enterprises Inc. $75.00 $90.00 $60.00 $60.00 $125.00
Disaster Mitigation & Construction Group | $110.55 $235.84 $73.70 $88.44 $235.84
Ceres Environmental $82.50 $125.00 $65.00 $60.00 $126.00
AshBritt $69.50 $124.50 $110.00 $79.50 $114.50
Omni Pinnacle $75.00 $85.00 $75.00 $65.00 $110.00
Bamaco Inc. $48.00 $100.00 $38.00 $28.00 $100.00
Crowder Gulf $65.00 $120.00 $64.00 $48.00 $125.00
J.B. Coxwell Contracting Inc $80.00 $105.00 $90.00 $78.50 $121.00
ATL Disaster Recovery $65.00 $125.00 $64.00 $45.00 $125.00
Phillips & Jordan Inc. $85.00 $125.00 $88.00 $85.00 $135.00
DRC Emergency Services LLC $98.00 $168.00 $95.00 $60.00 $175.00




Bid Number: RFP-PW-07-03
Date: March 26,2007

Name: Debris Management & Removal St
Time: 2:00 P.M.

Emergency Debris Clearance (Push)

* with operator 3 capcity **see page 45 of bid for more details

Rubber Tire Two Person Crew Crew Foreman Track Hoe
Contractor Dump Truck Front end w/chainsaw w/Pick-up 1/2 Excavator
16-20 yds 3 Cap* loader 3-5 yd* 16" min** to 1 ton w/phone 2-3 yd bucket*

hourly hourly hourly hourly hourly
Asplundh $68.25 $126.00 $79.80 $78.75 $144.38
Wood Resource Recovery LLC $55.00 $80.00 $75.00 $60.00 $110.00
Crowder Disaster Recovery Division $65.00 $120.00 $55.00 $50.00 $120.00
Baker Emergency Services $80.00 $95.00 $75.00 $62.50 $160.00




Bid Number: RFP-PW-07-03 arvices
Date: March 26,2007

Emergency Debris

Low Bed Trailer

Contractor 35 Ton Cap &

Tractor Truck*
hourly
D & J Enterprises Inc. $100.00
Disaster Mitigation & Construction Group $206.36
Ceres Environmental $125.00
AshBritt $89.50
Omni Pinnacle $115.00
Bamaco Inc. $85.00
Crowder Gulf $100.00
J.B. Coxwell Contracting Inc $125.00
ATL Disaster Recovery $100.00
Phillips & Jordan Inc. $125.00
DRC Emergency Services LLC $110.00




Bid Number: RFP-PW-07-03 arvices
Date: March 26,2007

Emergency Debris

Low Bed Trailer

Contractor 35 Ton Cap &
Tractor Truck*
hourly
Asplundh $144.38
Wood Resource Recovery LLC $80.00
Crowder Disaster Recovery Division $100.00
Baker Emergency Services $80.00




Bid Number: RFP-PW-07-03

Date:3/26/2007

Contractor

Removal of vegetative
debris from load site to
TDSR including sorting,
loading,hauling, etc.

Ebris Removal (Load & Haul)

Removal of construction &
demolittion debris and white
debris from assigned loadsite
to TDSR including sorting,
hauling, etc.

Removal of hazardous
waste debris from

curbside at assigned

load site to TDSR, including

sorting, loading, hauling etc.

Removal of silt & sand
deposits from assigned

load site to TDSR
including, sorting,
loading, hauling, etc.

Stump grubbing,removal & disposal

Removal & despose
of stump remnants

Miles Price Miles Price Miles Price Miles Price 24" to 48" 39" to 72" 73" & larger 73" & larger
Radius culyd. Radius culyd. Radius culyd. Radius culyd. each each each each

D & J Enterprises 0-15 $8.28 0-15 $8.50 0-15 $15.00 0-15 $15.00 $300.00 $575.00 $850.00 $850.00
16-30 $8.75 16-30 $9.00 16-30 $16.00 16-30 $16.00
31-60 $9.50 31-60 $9.75 31-60 $18.00 31-60 $18.00

168.75

Disaster Mitigation & Construction Group 0-15 $14.32 0-15 $14.32 0-15 $13.51 0-15 $14.32 $168.75 $303.75 $452.25 $573.75
16-30 $18.37 16-30 $18.37 16-30 $18.37 16-30 $18.37
31-60 $26.47 31-60 $26.47 31-60 $26.47 31-60 $26.47

Ceres Environmental 0-15 $9.98 0-15 $10.98 0-15 $29.50 0-15 $9.98 $295.00 $395.00 $695.00 $295.00
16-30 $10.98 16-30 $11.98 16-30 $31.00 16-30 $10.98
31-60 $11.98 31-60 $12.98 31-60 $32.50 31-60 $11.98

AshBritt 0-15 $9.50 0-15 $9.95 0-15 $14.95 0-15 $8.45 $425.00 $595.00 $695.00 $295.00
16-30 $10.45 16-30 $10.55 16-30 $17.95 16-30 $9.25
31-60 $11.45 31-60 $11.55 31-60 $20.95 31-60 $10.00

Omni Pinnacle 0-15 $9.15 0-15 $9.15 0-15 $9.15 0-15 $9.15 $250.00 $450.00 $700.00 $700.00
16-30 $9.65 16-30 $9.65 16-30 $9.65 16-30 $9.65
31-60 $10.00 31-60 $10.00 31-60 $10.00 31-60 $10.00

Bamaco Inc. 0-15 $8.00 0-15 $10.55 0-15 $13.00 0-15 $9.55 $175.00 $325.00 $475.00 $300.00
16-30 $10.00 16-30 $12.55 16-30 $15.00 16-30 $11.55
31-60 $13.00 31-60 $14.55 31-60 $17.00 31-60 $13.55

Crowder Gulf 0-15 $9.25 0-15 $9.25 0-15 $9.25 0-15 $9.25 $390.00 $800.00 $1,200.00 $1,000.00
16-30 $10.00 16-30 $10.00 16-30 $10.00 16-30 $10.00
31-60 $12.00 31-60 $12.00 31-60 $12.00 31-60 $12.00

J.B. Coxwell Contracting Inc 0-15 $11.90 0-15 $12.60 0-15 $19.10 0-15 $6.40 $395.00 $680.00 $1,110.00 $900.00
16-30 $11.90 16-30 $12.60 16-30 $21.10 16-30 $6.50
31-60 $12.63 31-60 $12.63 31-60 $23.00 31-60 $7.50

ATL Disaster Recovery 0-15 $10.00 0-15 $7.50 0-15 $8.00 0-15 $12.00 $500.00 $600.00 $800.00 $50.00
16-30 $11.00 16-30 $8.50 16-30 $10.00 16-30 $13.00
31-60 $12.50 31-60 $10.50 31-60 $12.00 31-60 $14.00

Phillips & Jordan Inc. 0-15 $9.75 0-15 $9.75 0-15 $37.00 0-15 $17.00 $675.00 $975.00 $1,175.00 $875.00
16-30 $10.75 16-30 $10.75 16-30 $38.00 16-30 $20.00
31-60 $11.75 31-60 $11.75 31-60 $40.00 31-60 $25.00

DRC Emergency Services LLC 0-15 $8.98 0-15 $9.28 0-15 $13.28 0-15 $13.60 $395.00 $575.00 $795.00 $550.00




Bid Number: RFP-PW-07-03

Date:3/26/2007

Ebris Removal (Load & Haul)

Contractor Removal of vegetative Removal of construction & Removal of hazardous Removal of silt & sand
debris from load site to demolittion debris and white waste debris from deposits from assigned
TDSR including sorting, debris from assigned loadsite curbside at assigned load site to TDSR
loading,hauling, etc. to TDSR including sorting, load site to TDSR, including including, sorting, Removal & despose
hauling, etc. sorting, loading, hauling etc. loading, hauling, etc. Stump grubbing,removal & disposal of stump remnants
Miles Price Miles Price Miles Price Miles Price 24" to 48" 39" to 72" 73" & larger 73" & larger
Radius culyd. Radius culyd. Radius culyd. Radius culyd. each each each each
16-30 $10.38 16-30 $10.68 16-30 $14.68 16-30 $14.70
31-60 $12.79 31-60 $13.18 31-60 $17.18 31-60 $17.68
Asplundh 0-15 $7.90 0-15 $9.20 0-15 $15.80 0-15 $9.20 $276.00 $473.00 $1,066.00 $1,066.00
16-30 $10.90 16-30 $12.00 16-30 $21.40 16-30 $12.00
31-60 $16.00 31-60 $17.00 31-60 $32.00 31-60 $17.00
Wood Resource Recovery LLC 0-15 $7.75 0-15 $7.75 0-15 $12.75 0-15 $8.75 $375.00 $575.00 $750.00 $350.00
16-30 $8.75 16-30 $8.75 16-30 $13.75 16-30 $9.75
31-60 $9.75 31-60 $9.75 31-60 $14.75 31-60 $10.75
Crowder Disaster Recovery Division 0-15 $8.65 0-15 $10.65 0-15 $10.65 0-15 $12.50 $450.00 $800.00 $1,200.00 $0.00
16-30 $9.65 16-30 $11.65 16-30 $11.65 16-30 $13.50
31-60 $10.65 31-60 $12.65 31-60 $12.65 31-60 $14.50
Baker Emergency Services 0-15 $8.75 0-15 $10.75 0-15 $12.75 0-15 $31.25 $190.00 $280.00 $350.00 $350.00
16-30 $9.75 16-30 $11.75 16-30 $13.75 16-30 $32.25
31-60 $10.75 31-60 $12.75 31-60 $14.75 31-60 $33.25




Bid Number: RFP-PW-07-03

Date:3/26/2007

Contractors

Spoiled food & non-hazardous
waste removal & disposal- The
removal shall include, sorting,
loading, handling, & hauling to

the final disposal site.

Hazardous Waste
Debris Removal
From Structures
See item #10 on
page 47 of bid.

Debris Removal (Load & Haul)

Private & public ROW
see page 47 of bid

item #11 for
complete description

Removal of unsafe
debris see page 47
of bid item #12 for

complete description

Name: Debris Management & Removal Servcies

Time: 2:00P.M.

Continued

Beach
Restoration

River & Canal
Shore Line
Restoration

River & Canal
debris removal

Per/Ton Sq. ft. of floor Price Price
space per/ton per/ton
[D & J Enterprises Inc. $50.00 $5.00 $12.00 $5.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Disaster Mitigation & Construction Group $69.32 $4.50 $14.23 $4.05 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Ceres Environmental $280.00 $5.90 $43.00 $3.90 No Bid No Bid No Bid
AshBritt $245.00 $3.25 $11.45 $2.00 Wood Incident spec Incident spec Incident spec
$3.00 Concret Lump Sum Lump Sum Lump Sum
Omni Pinnacle $1,800.00 $3.50 $17.00 $3.50 See Attached See Attached See Attached
Bamaco Inc. $175.00 $2.75 $12.55 $2.75 Cost + 10% Cost + 10% Cost + 10%
Crowder Gulf $200.00 $1.50 $22.00 $1.50 See proposal See proposal See proposal
J.B. Coxwell Contracting Inc $187.00 $4.00 $17.00 $3.10 See proposal See proposal See proposal
ATL Disaster Recovery $200.00 $1.50 $20.00 $1.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Phillips & Jordan Inc. $3,500.00 $0.75 $13.50 $1.50 See proposal See proposal See proposal
DRC Emergency Services LLC $125.00 $1.98 $21.42 $1.84 See proposal See proposal See proposal
Asplundh $18.60 $1.67 $3.00 $5.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Wood Resource Recovery LLC $200.00 $2.75 $13.75 $2.00 See proposal See proposal See proposal
Crowder Disaster Recovery Division $3,000.00 $0.25 $20.00 $10.00 See proposal See proposal See proposal
|Baker Emergency Services $200.00 $3.25 $13.25 $3.25 No Bid No Bid No Bid




Bid Number: RFP-PW-07-03

Date:3/26/2007

Contractors Sunken
Vessel
Removal
[D & J Enterprises Inc. No Bid
Disaster Mitigation & Construction Group No Bid
Ceres Environmental No Bid

AshBritt

Incident spec

Lump Sum

Omni Pinnacle

See Attached

Bamaco Inc.

Cost + 10%

Crowder Gulf

See proposal

J.B. Coxwell Contracting Inc

See proposal

ATL Disaster Recovery

No Bid

Phillips & Jordan Inc.

See proposal

DRC Emergency Services LLC

See proposal

Asplundh

No Bid

Wood Resource Recovery LLC

See proposal

Crowder Disaster Recovery Division

See proposal

|Baker Emergency Services

No Bid




Bid Number: RFP-PW-07-03

Date:3/26/2007

Contractor

*see item #1 on page 48 of bid

Management, processing

of all debris and/or

residue at the TSDR sites:*

TDR Site Management

** Prices do not include tipping fees

Final haul out

debris from the TDSR site to an

Name: Debris Management & Removal Servcies

Time: 2:00P.M.

of processed

to an approved dis sposal site.

Final haul out
of processed debris from the
the TDSR site to an approved
disposal site.

Freon Recovery
See item #4
on page 48 of bid

Price Price
culyd Miles Price Miles Price Per/Ton
Radius per culyd Radius Per/Ton
D & J Enterprises Inc. $3.75 0-15** $4.00 0-15** $4.00 $50.00
16-30** $5.00 16-30** $5.00
31-60** $7.00 31-60** $7.00
61-90** $10.00 61-90** $10.00
Disaster Mitigation & Construction Group $15.29 0-15 $14.32 0-15 $38.67 $54.00
16-30 $18.37 16-30 $49.61
31-60 $26.47 31-60 $71.48
61-90 $34.57 61-90 $93.35
Ceres Environmental $3.49 0-15 $3.74 0-15 $15.00 $1,100.00
16-30 $4.34 16-30 $17.00
31-60 $4.98 31-60 $22.00
61-90 $6.98 61-90 $26.00
AshBritt $3.75 0-15 $3.80 0-15 $23.00
16-30 $4.80 16-30 $29.00
31-60 $5.80 31-60 $37.00
61-90 $6.80 61-90 $49.00
Omni Pinnacle $3.25 0-15 2.85 0-15 $28.00 $2,000.00
16-30 $3.00 16-30 $30.00
31-60 $3.15 31-60 $31.00
61-90 $4.50 61-90 $45.00
Bamaco Inc. $4.75 0-15 $5.00 0-15 $20.00 $200.00
16-30 $6.00 16-30 $24.00
31-60 $7.00 31-60 $28.00
61-90 $8.00 61-90 $32.00
Crowder Gulf $1.50 0-15 $4.50 0-15 $16.00 $800.00
16-30 $5.00 16-30 $20.00
31-60 $6.00 31-60 $30.00
61-90 $7.50 61-90 $36.00
J.B. Coxwell Contracting Inc $4.90 0-15 $6.00 0-15 $96.00 $5,114.00
16-30 $6.25 16-30 $100.00
31-60 $6.75 31-60 $108.00
61-90 $7.90 61-90 $126.40




Bid Number: RFP-PW-07-03

Date:3/26/2007

Contractor

*see item #1 on page 48 of bid

Management, processing
of all debris and/or
residue at the TSDR sites:*

TDR Site Management

** Prices do not include tipping fees

Final haul out

debris from the TDSR site to an

Name: Debris Management & Removal Servcies

Time: 2:00P.M.

of processed

to an approved dis sposal site.

Final haul out

of processed debris from the
the TDSR site to an approved

disposal site.

Freon Recovery
See item #4
on page 48 of bid

Price Price
culyd Miles Price Miles Price Per/Ton
Radius per culyd Radius Per/Ton
ATL Disaster Recovery $5.00 0-15 $3.00 0-15 $15.00 $1.00
16-30 $3.00 16-30 $15.00
31-60 $4.00 31-60 $17.00
61-90 $4.00 61-90 $17.00
Phillips & Jordan Inc. $6.50 0-15 $3.50 0-15 $24.00 $60.00
16-30 $5.50 16-30 $30.00
31-60 $8.50 31-60 $42.50
61-90 $9.50 61-90 $50.00
DRC Emergency Services LLC $5.68 0-15 $3.98 0-15 $23.88 $140.00
16-30 $4.98 16-30 $32.86
31-60 $5.98 31-60 $42.12
61-90 $7.98 61-90 $49.82
Asplundh $3.50 0-15 $4.94 0-15 $19.75 $100.00 Each Appliance
16-30 $6.36 16-30 $25.45
31-60 $9.18 31-60 $36.70
61-90 $12.00 61-90 $48.00
Wood Resource Recovery LLC $4.25 0-15 $3.25 0-15 $16.00 $65.00 per unit
16-30 $4.40 16-30 $22.00
31-60 $4.90 31-60 $24.00
61-90 $5.40 61-90 $26.00
Crowder Disaster Recovery Division $3.50 0-15 $3.00 0-15 $13.50 $2,400.00
16-30 $4.00 16-30 $18.00
31-60 $5.00 31-60 $22.50
61-90 $6.00 61-90 $27.00
Baker Emergency Services $4.50 0-15 $5.00 0-15 $39.00 $400.00
16-30 $6.00 16-30 $41.00
31-60 $7.00 31-60 $43.00
61-90 $8.00 61-90 $45.00




Bid Number: RFP-PW-07-03

Date:3/26/2007

Tree Removal and Diposal

Name: Debris Management & Removal Servcies

Time: 2:00P.M.

Tree & Limb Removal

Limb removal and disposail

Contractor
1to5 6to 10 11 or Other disaster
4" to 12" 13" to 24" 37" to 48" 49" greater limbs limbs greater related services
DBH DBH DBH DBH per tree pre tree per tree

D & J Enterprises Inc. $50.00 $125.00 $225.00 $500.00 $100.00 $175.00 $275.00 See Propsoal
Disaster Mitigation & Construction Group $98.55 $243.00 $573.75 $810.00 $67.50 $135.00 $202.50 See Propsoal
Ceres Environmental $145.00 $445.00 $995.00 $1,395.00 $95.00 $155.00 $195.00 See Propsoal
Ashbritt $150.00 $325.00 $550.00 $750.00 $115.00 $115.00 $115.00 See Propsoal
Omni Pinnacle $25.00 $45.00 $85.00 $95.00 $75.00 $85.00 $95.00 See Propsoal
Bamaco Inc. $60.00 $65.00 $70.00 $75.00 $60.00 $80.00 $100.00 See Propsoal
Crowder Gulf $85.00 $135.00 $460.00 $900.00 $140.00 $200.00 $275.00 See Propsoal
J.B. Coxwell Contracting Inc $85.00 $160.00 $595.00 $730.00 $27.10 $17.00 $13.00 See Propsoal
ATL Disaster Recovery $90.00 $250.00 $380.00 $800.00 $135.00 $150.00 $160.00 See Propsoal
Phillips & Jordan Inc. $195.00 $295.00 $795.00 $1,095.00 $50.00 $65.00 $85.00 See Propsoal
DRC Emergency Services LLC $125.00 $320.00 $500.00 $750.00 $85.00 $95.00 $105.00 See Propsoal
Asplundh $166.65 $433.30 $1,033.00 $1,320.00 $82.65 $96.00 $109.30 See Propsoal
Wood Resource Recovery LLC $135.00 $325.00 $510.00 $725.00 $125.00 $200.00 $325.00 See Propsoal
Crowder Disaster Recovery Division $50.00 $175.00 $275.00 $525.00 $55.00 $55.00 $55.00 See Propsoal
|Baker Emergency Services $62.50 $125.00 $187.50 $312.50 $50.00 $65.00 $80.00 See Propsoal




